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The First International Conference on Digital Forensics and Cyber Crime (ICDF2C) was held in Albany
from September 30 to October 2, 2009. The field of digital for- sics is growing rapidly with implications for
several fields including law enforcement, network security, disaster recovery and accounting. This is a
multidisciplinary area that requires expertise in several areas including, law, computer science, finance,
networking, data mining, and criminal justice. This conference brought together pr- titioners and researchers
from diverse fields providing opportunities for business and intellectual engagement among attendees. All
the conference sessions were very well attended with vigorous discussions and strong audience interest. The
conference featured an excellent program comprising high-quality paper pr- entations and invited speakers
from all around the world. The first day featured a plenary session including George Philip, President of
University at Albany, Harry Corbit, Suprintendent of New York State Police, and William Pelgrin, Director
of New York State Office of Cyber Security and Critical Infrastructure Coordination. An outstanding
keynote was provided by Miklos Vasarhelyi on continuous auditing. This was followed by two parallel
sessions on accounting fraud /financial crime, and m- timedia and handheld forensics. The second day of the
conference featured a mesm- izing keynote talk by Nitesh Dhanjani from Ernst and Young that focused on
psyc- logical profiling based on open source intelligence from social network analysis. The third day of the
conference featured both basic and advanced tutorials on open source forensics.
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From reader reviews:

Lois Yale:

Now a day those who Living in the era where everything reachable by talk with the internet and the
resources included can be true or not need people to be aware of each data they get. How a lot more to be
smart in receiving any information nowadays? Of course the solution is reading a book. Looking at a book
can help folks out of this uncertainty Information especially this Digital Forensics and Cyber Crime: First
International ICST Conference, ICDF2C 2009, Albany, Ny, USA, September 30 - October 2, 2009, Revised
Selected ... and Telecommunications Engineering) book since this book offers you rich info and knowledge.
Of course the information in this book hundred pct guarantees there is no doubt in it you know.

Lottie Jowers:

Reading a reserve tends to be new life style within this era globalization. With studying you can get a lot of
information that could give you benefit in your life. Along with book everyone in this world can certainly
share their idea. Ebooks can also inspire a lot of people. A great deal of author can inspire their very own
reader with their story or maybe their experience. Not only the storyplot that share in the guides. But also
they write about the ability about something that you need example of this. How to get the good score toefl,
or how to teach your sons or daughters, there are many kinds of book which exist now. The authors
nowadays always try to improve their skill in writing, they also doing some exploration before they write
with their book. One of them is this Digital Forensics and Cyber Crime: First International ICST Conference,
ICDF2C 2009, Albany, Ny, USA, September 30 - October 2, 2009, Revised Selected ... and
Telecommunications Engineering).

Walter Crouse:

Don't be worry in case you are afraid that this book will probably filled the space in your house, you can
have it in e-book method, more simple and reachable. This Digital Forensics and Cyber Crime: First
International ICST Conference, ICDF2C 2009, Albany, Ny, USA, September 30 - October 2, 2009, Revised
Selected ... and Telecommunications Engineering) can give you a lot of close friends because by you looking
at this one book you have factor that they don't and make you more like an interesting person. This particular
book can be one of a step for you to get success. This publication offer you information that perhaps your
friend doesn't know, by knowing more than additional make you to be great people. So , why hesitate? Let us
have Digital Forensics and Cyber Crime: First International ICST Conference, ICDF2C 2009, Albany, Ny,
USA, September 30 - October 2, 2009, Revised Selected ... and Telecommunications Engineering).

Brenda Moulton:

As a university student exactly feel bored to be able to reading. If their teacher expected them to go to the
library in order to make summary for some reserve, they are complained. Just very little students that has



reading's spirit or real their pastime. They just do what the trainer want, like asked to go to the library. They
go to generally there but nothing reading seriously. Any students feel that studying is not important, boring
and can't see colorful pics on there. Yeah, it is to become complicated. Book is very important for you. As
we know that on this period of time, many ways to get whatever we wish. Likewise word says, ways to reach
Chinese's country. Therefore , this Digital Forensics and Cyber Crime: First International ICST Conference,
ICDF2C 2009, Albany, Ny, USA, September 30 - October 2, 2009, Revised Selected ... and
Telecommunications Engineering) can make you really feel more interested to read.
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