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Teachers the world over are discovering the importance and benefits of incorporating popular culture into the
music classroom. The cultural prevalence and the students' familiarity with recorded music, videos, games,
and other increasingly accessible multimedia materials help enliven course content and foster interactive
learning and participation. Pop-Culture Pedagogy in the Music Classroom: Teaching Tools from American
Idol to YouTube provides ideas and techniques for teaching music classes using elements of popular culture
that resonate with students' everyday lives. From popular songs and genres to covers, mixes, and mashups;
from video games such as Dance Dance Revolution and Guitar Hero to television shows like American Idol,
this exciting collection offers pedagogical models for incorporating pop culture and its associated
technologies into a wide variety of music courses.

Biamonte has collected well-rounded essays that consider a variety of applications. After an introduction, the
essays are organized in 3 sections. The first addresses general tools and technology that can be incorporated
into almost any music class: sound-mixing techniques and the benefits of using iPods and YouTube. The
middle section uses popular songs, video games, or other aspects of pop culture to demonstrate music-theory
topics or to develop ear-training and rhythmic skills. The final section examines the musical, lyrical, or
visual content in popular songs, genres, or videos as a point of departure for addressing broader issues and
contexts. Each chapter contains notes and a bibliography, and two comprehensive appendixes list popular
song examples for teaching harmony, melody, and rhythm. Two indexes cross-reference the material by title
and by general subject. While written with college and secondary-school teachers in mind, the methods and
materials presented here can be adapted to any educational level.
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From reader reviews:

Julia Gilmore:

Do you have favorite book? In case you have, what is your favorite's book? Reserve is very important thing
for us to know everything in the world. Each e-book has different aim or even goal; it means that guide has
different type. Some people really feel enjoy to spend their time for you to read a book. They may be reading
whatever they get because their hobby is definitely reading a book. Think about the person who don't like
looking at a book? Sometime, man feel need book when they found difficult problem or even exercise. Well,
probably you will want this Pop-Culture Pedagogy in the Music Classroom: Teaching Tools from American
Idol to YouTube.

Janice Martin:

Do you one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt if you are in the book store? Attempt to
pick one book that you find out the inside because don't ascertain book by its handle may doesn't work at this
point is difficult job because you are scared that the inside maybe not because fantastic as in the outside look
likes. Maybe you answer could be Pop-Culture Pedagogy in the Music Classroom: Teaching Tools from
American Idol to YouTube why because the excellent cover that make you consider concerning the content
will not disappoint an individual. The inside or content is definitely fantastic as the outside or even cover.
Your reading 6th sense will directly direct you to pick up this book.

Michael Becker:

It is possible to spend your free time to read this book this e-book. This Pop-Culture Pedagogy in the Music
Classroom: Teaching Tools from American Idol to YouTube is simple to create you can read it in the
playground, in the beach, train and also soon. If you did not get much space to bring the particular printed
book, you can buy the e-book. It is make you better to read it. You can save the particular book in your smart
phone. And so there are a lot of benefits that you will get when you buy this book.

Joan Morris:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that will question when you got pupils? We believe that that issue was
given by teacher for their students. Many kinds of hobby, Every person has different hobby. Therefore you
know that little person including reading or as looking at become their hobby. You have to know that reading
is very important and book as to be the issue. Book is important thing to add you knowledge, except your
personal teacher or lecturer. You will find good news or update in relation to something by book. Different
categories of books that can you take to be your object. One of them is actually Pop-Culture Pedagogy in the
Music Classroom: Teaching Tools from American Idol to YouTube.
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