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Even though former slaves Annie Coats and her son Gabriel have managed to buy their freedom, their lives
are still marked by constant struggle and sacrifice--to the extent that Annie secretly recalls her days on the
plantation with fondness. Washington's Georgetown neighborhood, where the Coatses are seeking to build
their new lives--with Gabriel, a tailor, producing uniforms for soldiers and fine suits for pompous politicians,
and Annie, a seamstress and laundress, catering to the nearby brothels and stately homes--is supposed to be a
safe haven, a "promised land" for former slaves, but is effectively a frontier town, gritty and dangerous, with
no laws protecting black people. In fact, the city's own emancipation efforts in 1862 serve only to
compromise the Coats family's status, putting Gabriel's three young daughters (each of them born free of free
parents) at risk of becoming the property of the Coatses' former master. The remarkable emotional energy
with which the Coatses rise their daily battles--as they negotiate with their former owner, as they assist other
former slaves en route to freedom, as they prepare for the encroaching war, and as they struggle to love each
other enough--is what fuels this novel and makes its tragic denoument so devastating.
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From reader reviews:

Lori Hunt:

Reading a publication tends to be new life style in this era globalization. With reading through you can get a
lot of information that can give you benefit in your life. Having book everyone in this world may share their
idea. Textbooks can also inspire a lot of people. Many author can inspire their reader with their story or
perhaps their experience. Not only the story that share in the publications. But also they write about the data
about something that you need case in point. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your young
ones, there are many kinds of book that exist now. The authors on this planet always try to improve their
talent in writing, they also doing some exploration before they write with their book. One of them is this
Stand the Storm.

Alma Saunders:

A lot of people always spent their own free time to vacation as well as go to the outside with them household
or their friend. Do you know? Many a lot of people spent these people free time just watching TV, or maybe
playing video games all day long. If you wish to try to find a new activity that's look different you can read a
new book. It is really fun to suit your needs. If you enjoy the book you read you can spent 24 hours a day to
reading a guide. The book Stand the Storm it is rather good to read. There are a lot of folks that
recommended this book. We were holding enjoying reading this book. In case you did not have enough
space to bring this book you can buy typically the e-book. You can m0ore easily to read this book through
your smart phone. The price is not too expensive but this book offers high quality.

Bryant Kelly:

Playing with family in a park, coming to see the marine world or hanging out with good friends is thing that
usually you could have done when you have spare time, after that why you don't try point that really opposite
from that. One activity that make you not experiencing tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster
you have been ride on and with addition of knowledge. Even you love Stand the Storm, you can enjoy both.
It is very good combination right, you still desire to miss it? What kind of hangout type is it? Oh can occur
its mind hangout guys. What? Still don't buy it, oh come on its referred to as reading friends.

Marni Johnson:

The book untitled Stand the Storm contain a lot of information on that. The writer explains your girlfriend
idea with easy way. The language is very clear to see all the people, so do not worry, you can easy to read it.
The book was published by famous author. The author provides you in the new period of literary works. You
can actually read this book because you can continue reading your smart phone, or gadget, so you can read
the book inside anywhere and anytime. In a situation you wish to purchase the e-book, you can available
their official web-site in addition to order it. Have a nice go through.
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