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The Oxford Handbook of Comparative Regionalism - the first of its kind - offers a systematic and wide-
ranging survey of the scholarship on regionalism, regionalization, and regional governance.

Unpacking the major debates, leading authors of the field synthesize the state of the art, provide a guide to
the comparative study of regionalism, and identify future avenues of research. Twenty-seven chapters review
the theoretical and empirical scholarship with regard to the emergence of regionalism, the institutional design
of regional organizations and issue-specific governance, as well as the effects of regionalism and its
relationship with processes of regionalization. The authors
explore theories of cooperation, integration, and diffusion explaining the rise and the different forms of
regionalism. The handbook also discusses the state of the art on the world regions: North America, Latin
America, Europe, Eurasia, Asia, North Africa and the Middle East, and Sub-Saharan Africa.
Various chapters survey the literature on regional governance in major issue areas such as security and
peace, trade and finance, environment, migration, social and gender policies, as well as democracy and
human rights. Finally, the handbook engages in cross-regional comparisons with regard to institutional
design, dispute settlement, identities and communities, legitimacy and democracy, as well as inter- and
transregionalism.
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From reader reviews:

Patricia Vasquez:

This The Oxford Handbook of Comparative Regionalism (Oxford Handbooks) book is not ordinary book,
you have after that it the world is in your hands. The benefit you have by reading this book is information
inside this e-book incredible fresh, you will get info which is getting deeper you actually read a lot of
information you will get. This kind of The Oxford Handbook of Comparative Regionalism (Oxford
Handbooks) without we realize teach the one who studying it become critical in contemplating and
analyzing. Don't become worry The Oxford Handbook of Comparative Regionalism (Oxford Handbooks)
can bring once you are and not make your carrier space or bookshelves' come to be full because you can
have it in your lovely laptop even cell phone. This The Oxford Handbook of Comparative Regionalism
(Oxford Handbooks) having great arrangement in word in addition to layout, so you will not experience
uninterested in reading.

Domingo Adams:

Reading a e-book can be one of a lot of task that everyone in the world adores. Do you like reading book
consequently. There are a lot of reasons why people like it. First reading a guide will give you a lot of new
information. When you read a reserve you will get new information simply because book is one of a number
of ways to share the information or even their idea. Second, reading a book will make anyone more
imaginative. When you reading a book especially tale fantasy book the author will bring someone to imagine
the story how the personas do it anything. Third, you are able to share your knowledge to other folks. When
you read this The Oxford Handbook of Comparative Regionalism (Oxford Handbooks), you could tells your
family, friends in addition to soon about yours publication. Your knowledge can inspire the others, make
them reading a reserve.

Teresita Donahue:

Are you kind of stressful person, only have 10 or even 15 minute in your day time to upgrading your mind
expertise or thinking skill actually analytical thinking? Then you have problem with the book compared to
can satisfy your limited time to read it because this all time you only find publication that need more time to
be learn. The Oxford Handbook of Comparative Regionalism (Oxford Handbooks) can be your answer since
it can be read by an individual who have those short time problems.

David Cormier:

As we know that book is vital thing to add our expertise for everything. By a guide we can know everything
we would like. A book is a list of written, printed, illustrated or maybe blank sheet. Every year had been
exactly added. This book The Oxford Handbook of Comparative Regionalism (Oxford Handbooks) was
filled regarding science. Spend your extra time to add your knowledge about your technology competence.
Some people has distinct feel when they reading a new book. If you know how big advantage of a book, you



can sense enjoy to read a guide. In the modern era like currently, many ways to get book you wanted.
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