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Virginia Woolf wrote the short story “The New Dress” in 1924. It was made in preparation of her novel
“Mrs. Dalloway”. The same Mrs. Dalloway is the one giving the party in “The New Dress”. It is a story
about the feelings of a woman towards herself and her reaction to the behaviours of others when they meet
her. The protagonist is Mable Waring, a woman at the age of 40, who is invited to a party at a friend´s house.
Because of this occasion Mable´s dressmaker makes her a new dress, which Mabel has found in an old
fashion book of her mother. She likes that yellow dress very much until she arrives at the party where she
can see and feel how the other guests look at her. She starts to feel uncomfortable and searches for
confirmation wherever she can. But Mabel does not get the confirmation she is looking for. During her stay
at the party she has several flashbacks which remind her of the moments at the dressmaker Miss Milan and
of her past. These moments make her happy but also aware of the situation she is in at the party which makes
her sad again. At these occasions she always compares herself to a fly trying to get over the edge of a saucer.
At the end of the story she thinks about changing her life and leaves the party with this new feeling.

It is a bit difficult to understand all aspects of this short story completely. The reader has to read the story
more than one time to really comprehend the strong feelings which are going on in the protagonists psyche.
The stream-ofconsciousness technique which Virginia Woolf is famous for, makes the story more interesting
and shows the reader the inside of Mabel. She also uses quite a few images which should be understood by
the reader. The new dress and thus women’s consciousness of fashion have to be considered. The protagonist
Mabel is not a very strong character and does not have much selfconfidence, that is why she can be easily
influenced by others. She uses flashbacks to escape the reality but these happy feelings are only temporary.
At the end nothing has really changed for Mabel and she will always stay the way she is. [...]
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From reader reviews:

James Lindberg:

Book is to be different per grade. Book for children right up until adult are different content. As it is known
to us that book is very important usually. The book Virginia Woolf "The New Dress" had been making you
to know about other information and of course you can take more information. It is very advantages for you.
The book Virginia Woolf "The New Dress" is not only giving you considerably more new information but
also for being your friend when you sense bored. You can spend your spend time to read your e-book. Try to
make relationship using the book Virginia Woolf "The New Dress". You never really feel lose out for
everything in the event you read some books.

Heidi Odom:

This Virginia Woolf "The New Dress" book is just not ordinary book, you have after that it the world is in
your hands. The benefit you will get by reading this book is definitely information inside this book incredible
fresh, you will get information which is getting deeper you read a lot of information you will get. This kind
of Virginia Woolf "The New Dress" without we understand teach the one who examining it become critical
in pondering and analyzing. Don't always be worry Virginia Woolf "The New Dress" can bring when you are
and not make your bag space or bookshelves' turn into full because you can have it in your lovely laptop
even phone. This Virginia Woolf "The New Dress" having great arrangement in word along with layout, so
you will not experience uninterested in reading.

Steven Ellison:

That e-book can make you to feel relax. That book Virginia Woolf "The New Dress" was bright colored and
of course has pictures around. As we know that book Virginia Woolf "The New Dress" has many kinds or
genre. Start from kids until young adults. For example Naruto or Detective Conan you can read and believe
that you are the character on there. Therefore , not at all of book are generally make you bored, any it offers
you feel happy, fun and loosen up. Try to choose the best book for yourself and try to like reading which.

George Hyler:

Some individuals said that they feel weary when they reading a reserve. They are directly felt the idea when
they get a half portions of the book. You can choose often the book Virginia Woolf "The New Dress" to
make your current reading is interesting. Your own skill of reading ability is developing when you like
reading. Try to choose basic book to make you enjoy to learn it and mingle the opinion about book and
reading through especially. It is to be initial opinion for you to like to available a book and learn it. Beside
that the e-book Virginia Woolf "The New Dress" can to be your friend when you're feel alone and confuse
with what must you're doing of these time.
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