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Cyber Blockades is the first book to examine the phenomena of blockade operations in cyberspace, large-
scale attacks on infrastructure or systems that aim to prevent an entire state from sending or receiving
electronic data. Cyber blockades can take place through digital, physical, and/or electromagnetic means.
Blockade operations have historically been considered acts of war, thus their emergence in cyberspace has
significant implications for international law and for our understanding of cyber warfare.

The author defines and explains the emerging concept of "cyber blockades" and presents a unique
comparison of blockade operations in five different domains?on land, at sea, in the air, in space, and in
cyberspace?identifying common elements as well as important distinctions. Alison Lawlor Russell's
framework for defining cyber blockades, understanding how they occur, and considering the motivations of
actors who employ them is applied with in-depth analysis of the cyber attacks on Estonia in 2007 and on
Georgia during the 2008 Georgia-Russia War.

Blockade operations have occurred in cyberspace and will doubtlessly be used again in the future, by both
state and non-state actors alike, because of the unique advantages of this type of attack. This book offers
recommendations for policymakers contemplating or confronted by such attacks. Cyber Blockades is also a
must-read for scholars and students of security studies, terrorism, substate groups, and the future of warfare.
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From reader reviews:

Ethel Davidson:

Hey guys, do you desires to finds a new book to read? May be the book with the name Cyber Blockades
suitable to you? Often the book was written by well-known writer in this era. The actual book untitled Cyber
Blockadesis the one of several books that will everyone read now. That book was inspired a lot of people in
the world. When you read this e-book you will enter the new dimension that you ever know before. The
author explained their idea in the simple way, so all of people can easily to comprehend the core of this e-
book. This book will give you a wide range of information about this world now. To help you to see the
represented of the world in this book.

Marisa Carney:

People live in this new moment of lifestyle always try and and must have the time or they will get lot of
stress from both way of life and work. So , if we ask do people have free time, we will say absolutely of
course. People is human not a robot. Then we ask again, what kind of activity do you possess when the spare
time coming to a person of course your answer can unlimited right. Then ever try this one, reading books. It
can be your alternative inside spending your spare time, the particular book you have read is actually Cyber
Blockades.

Victor Parisi:

Do you like reading a guide? Confuse to looking for your preferred book? Or your book has been rare? Why
so many concern for the book? But any kind of people feel that they enjoy for reading. Some people likes
looking at, not only science book but novel and Cyber Blockades or even others sources were given expertise
for you. After you know how the truly amazing a book, you feel desire to read more and more. Science
publication was created for teacher as well as students especially. Those books are helping them to bring
their knowledge. In additional case, beside science publication, any other book likes Cyber Blockades to
make your spare time a lot more colorful. Many types of book like this one.

Ronald Smith:

As a scholar exactly feel bored for you to reading. If their teacher questioned them to go to the library or
make summary for some guide, they are complained. Just very little students that has reading's heart or real
their passion. They just do what the professor want, like asked to go to the library. They go to generally there
but nothing reading very seriously. Any students feel that reading through is not important, boring and also
can't see colorful pictures on there. Yeah, it is to become complicated. Book is very important to suit your
needs. As we know that on this period of time, many ways to get whatever we really wish for. Likewise word
says, ways to reach Chinese's country. So , this Cyber Blockades can make you feel more interested to read.
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